
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

LT 215/85R 16
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 6 Firestone $81.55 $489.30 Cooper $106.00 $636.00
LT 245/75R 16
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 15 Firestone $74.95 $1,124.25 Firestone $84.01 $1,260.15

LT 245/75R 17-121/118S 8 Firestone $91.35 $730.80 Cooper $155.10 $1,240.80
LT 225/75R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $82.20 $822.00 Firestone $76.53 $765.30
LT 235/75R 15 LOAD RANGE D
All Season Tread 15 Firestone $75.60 $1,134.00 Cooper $70.00 $1,050.00
LT 235/85R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Terrrain On/Off Road Design 25 Firestone $77.75 $1,943.75 Firestone $77.75 $1,943.75
LT 235/85R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Season 20 Firestone $75.40 $1,508.00 Firestone $75.40 $1,508.00
LT 225/75R 16 LOAD RANGE D
Premium Steel - All Position - Long Tread 6 Bridgestone $115.00 $690.00 Bridgestone $127.99 $767.94
LT 265/75R 16 8 Firestone $77.75 $622.00 Firestone $81.45 $651.60
LT 275/70 R 18 = 125/122S 8 Continental $171.11 $1,368.88 Cooper $209.00 $1,672.00
P215/70 R 14
All Season Tread 4 Firestone $46.00 $184.00 Cooper $52.00 $208.00
P215/75 R 15
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $51.55 $515.50 Cooper $42.00 $420.00
P225/75 R 16 8 Firestone $76.95 $615.60 Cooper $78.00 $624.00
P235/70 R 15
All Season Tread 20 Firestone $77.40 $1,548.00 Cooper $77.00 $1,540.00

P235/70 R 16 - RT/S
Standard Load 40 Firestone $81.40 $3,256.00 Yokohama $90.00 $3,600.00
P265/70 R 17 - HT 8 Firestone $89.00 $712.00 Cooper $100.00 $800.00
P265/70 R 17 - AT 8 Firestone $88.10 $704.80 Duran $97.00 $776.00
P265/75 R 16 - AT 8 Firestone $86.65 $693.20 Firestone $71.19 $569.52
P 235/75R 15 WHITE LETTER STANDARD
All Weather On/Off Road Tread 18 Firestone $75.22 $1,353.96 Cooper $80.00 $1,440.00
P 245/75R 16 WHITE LETTER STANDARD
Aggressive All Terrain Traction 29 Firestone $81.90 $2,375.10 Cooper $124.00 $3,596.00

P 225/75R 15 WHITE WALL STANDARD
All Weather On/Off Road Tread 35 Firestone $71.45 $2,500.75 Cooper $44.00 $1,540.00

180/70 R 8 X2R 10 Continental $120.89 $1,208.90 No bid  
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DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

P 185/70R 14 AQUA TRED II
Heavy Duty On/Off Road Highway Traction 4 Firestone $56.20 $224.80 Michelin $99.00 $396.00
P 225/70R 15 WHITE WALL STANDARD
Wet Traction (Goodyear Aqua Tread or equal) 16 Firestone $69.95 $1,119.20 Cooper $65.00 $1,040.00
P 205/65R 15 STANDARD
All Season Tread Design 8 Firestone $47.45 $379.60 Cooper $50.00 $400.00
P 225/70R 16 STANDARD
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 16 Firestone $79.00 $1,264.00 Cooper $89.00 $1,424.00
P 185/75R 14 STANDARD
Advanced Rib, All Season Tread Design 4 Firestone $41.00 $164.00 Cooper $44.00 $176.00
P195/75R 14 STANDARD
Advanced Rib, All Season Tread Design 2 Firestone $42.30 $84.60 Cooper $48.00 $96.00
Workhorse Heavy Duty Extra Grip Radial On/Off 
Highway 4

This is an LT tire bid 
elsewhere on this bid. $77.75 $311.00 Cooper $103.00 $412.00

P225/60 R 16
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $52.00 $520.00 Cooper $58.00 $580.00
225/70R 19.5 LOAD RANGE F
Wrangler Radial (Goodyear or equal) 15 Bridgestone $175.00 $2,625.00 Bridgestone $181.28 $2,719.20
265/70R 19.5  LOAD RANGE G
All Position - Street Tread 16 Bridgestone $205.00 $3,280.00 Bridgestone $208.75 $3,340.00
315/80R 22.5 LOAD RANGE J                                  
Goodyear G291 2 Firestone $325.00 $650.00 Bridgestone $395.00 $790.00
355/80D 20 PILLOW DIA-1                                       
Bridgestone 2 Bridgestone $327.51 $655.02 Toyo $370.00 $740.00
395/85R 20                                                                   
All Terrain (Goodyear MV/T) 4 No bid   Bridgestone $295.00 $1,180.00

445/65R 22.5 Mich XZL 20 Ply
4 Michelin $568.00 $2,272.00 Michelin $678.59 $2,714.36

7.50R 16 LT PLY RATING D
Heavy Duty On/Off Road Highway Traction 10

This is a metric tire bid 
elsewhere on this bid. $77.75 $777.50 Cooper $105.00 $1,050.00

8R 19.5 LOAD RANGE F
Unisteel G159 (Goodyear or equal) 5 Bridgestone $121.35 $606.75 Bridgestone $145.36 $726.80
10.00-16 8-PLY R
Three Rib 4 Firestone $96.74 $386.96 Firestone $100.09 $400.36
10.00-16 8-PLY R
Four Rib 4 Firestone $97.44 $389.76 Primex $95.00 $380.00
18.4-4-34
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 Firestone $408.40 $816.80 Primex $395.00 $790.00
20.5 X 8.010 2 no bid   Carlisle $50.00 $100.00
12 R 24.5
All Terrain On/Off Road Highway Traction 2 Firestone $280.00 $560.00 Michelin $400.00 $800.00
10 R 22.5 STEERING, LOAD RANGE F                  
Goodyear G159 1 Firestone $210.00 $210.00 Firestone $211.72 $211.72
10 R 22.5 DRIVING, LOAD RANGE F                     
Goodyear G159 1 Firestone $210.00 $210.00 Firestone $201.22 $201.22
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DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

11 R 22.5 STEERING 25 Firestone $215.00 $5,375.00 Firestone $225.00 $5,625.00

11 R 22.5 DRIVING 25 Firestone $225.00 $5,625.00 Firestone $257.00 $6,425.00
425/65 R 22.5
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 Firestone $360.00 $720.00 Firestone $369.00 $738.00
22.5 G 159 (Firetruck)
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 no bid   Michelin $425.00 $850.00
24X2.125
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 4 no bid   No bid $0.00
5.70-8 LOAD RANGE C                                            
Carlisle 12 no bid   Carlisle $29.00 $348.00
4.80-12 LIGHTED X
All Season Tread 2 no bid   Carlisle $40.00 $80.00
12-16.5 NHS 10 PLY                                                  
Bobcat 4 Firestone $119.84 $479.36 Primex $99.00 $396.00
27 X 10.50 - 15 NHS Bobcat 4 Firestone $105.67 $422.68 Primex $105.00 $420.00
14-17.5 NHS 10 PLY                                                  
Backhoe 2 Firestone $205.20 $410.40 Primex $180.00 $360.00
16.9-28 8 PLY                                                             
Backhoe 2 Firestone $326.45 $652.90 Firestone $326.45 $652.90
24 R 21 XZL 10 Michelin $1,749.00 $17,490.00 Michelin $2,192.63 $21,926.30
18.4 - 30 Tractor 2 Firestone $392.53 $785.06 Del Nat $320.00 $640.00
9.5L - 15 Tractor 4 RIB 2 Firestone $87.03 $174.06 Primex $50.00 $100.00
25 X 8.50 - 14 NHS                                                     
Tractor                   1 Firestone $69.26 $69.26 Carlisle $80.00 $80.00

25.5 X 8.0 - 14 - 4 RIB Goodyear Aircraft RIB 8 no bid   no bid  
25.5 X 8.0 - 14  1 no bid   no bid  
13-6.50-6 4P Carl Multi Rib 5 no bid   Carlisle $20.00 $100.00
305 70D 16.5 2 Firestone $119.84 $239.68 Firestone $220.00 $440.00
265 70D 16.5 4 Firestone $84.02 $336.08 Cooper $80.00 $320.00

   
Number of tires bidder bid on out of 65 tires total = 55.     

$75,178.36 $84,119.92

 

 

Total Cost to Authority if all quantities of tires were purchased for only  those 55 tires that both bidders bid.
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DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

TYPE OF TIRE SIZE HUBER TIRE
BOB 

SUMEREL 
TIRE

 

PASSENGER/LIGHT TRUCK TIRES 14", 15" AND 16" $4.00 $3.00  

HEAVY TRUCK/TRACTOR - ON AND OFF 
ROAD

     19.5", 20", 21",     
22.5" & 24" $6.50 $6.50  

INDUSTRIAL BACKHOE/GRADER 40 X 14 $7.50 $8.00  

ON AND OFF ROAD
     19.5", 20", 21",     
22.5", 24" & 25" $20.00 $6.50  

BID PRICE FOR DISPOSAL OF USED TIRES
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