RESPONSES DUE:

10/7/2007

BID NUMBER & DESCRIPTION

AFM2007-001 POTASSIUM ACETATE

CONTRACT MANAGER:

YVETTE LEWIS

DEPARTMENT REQUESTOR:

AIRFIELD MAINTENANCE

PRESENT AT OPENING:

YVETTE LEWIS

BARB JOHNSON

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

VENDOR

CARGIL

CLARIANT CORPORATION

OLD WORLD INDUSTRIES

CRYOTECH

24950 COUNTRY CLUB BLVD, STE 450

625 E. CATAWBA AVE

4065 COMMERCIAL AVE

6103 ORTHOWAY

NORTH OLMSTED, OHIO

MOUNT HOLLY, NC 28120

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062

FT. MADISON, IA 52627

JEANNE DONNELLY

BRYAN MCCREARY

MICHAEL BUSCHEK

LAURA MASON

BRYAN.MCCREARY@CLARIANT.COM

MBUSCHEK@OLDWORLDIND.COM

laura.mason@cryotech.com

PHONE 800-600-7258

PHONE 704-822-2184

PHONE 847-559-2116

PHONE 319-372-6012

FAX 888-739-8705

FAX 704-822-2193

FAX 847-664-7116

FAX 319-372-2662

LINE |PRODUCT QUANTITY |QUOTE TOTAL QUOTE TOTAL QUOTE TOTAL QUOTE TOTAL
1 |[POTASSIUM ACETATE 50,000 GAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00
FREIGHT TO CMH 1 EA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
12 LOADS
2 |POTASSIUM ACETATE 15,000 GAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FREIGHT TO LCK 1 EA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
4 LOADS
TOTAL FOR CRAA $163,800.00)
3 |POTASSIUM ACETATE 100,000 GAL NO BID $2.68| $268,000.00 $2.31| $231,000.00 $3.27| $327,000.00
FREIGHT TO LOUISVILLE 1 EA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
4 |POTASSIUM ACETATE 30,000 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FREIGHT TO TOLEDO EX 1 EA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
NOTES: NOTES: NOTES: NOTES: NOTES:
This quote has changed due to Deliveries required within 24 hours
questions answered will have an additional $0.16 added
through Addendum #1. to the per gallon price.




