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ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

LT 215/85R 16
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 6 Firestone $74.50 $447.00 Powerking $87.68 $526.08 Uniroyal $82.49 $494.94
LT 245/75R 16
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 15 Firestone $69.25 $1,038.75 Powerking $99.23 $1,488.45 Uniroyal $93.40 $1,401.00

LT 245/75R 17-121/118S 8 no bid $0.00 Continental $99.75 $798.00 BF Goodrich $95.02 $760.16
LT 225/75R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $68.80 $688.00 Import $68.25 $682.50 Uniroyal $80.47 $804.70
LT 235/75R 15 LOAD RANGE D
All Season Tread 15 Firestone $73.15 $1,097.25 Goodyear $126.56 $1,898.40 Uniroyal $65.41 $981.15
LT 235/85R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Terrrain On/Off Road Design 25 Firestone $71.80 $1,795.00 Federal $68.78 $1,719.50 Uniroyal $75.44 $1,886.00
LT 235/85R 16 LOAD RANGE E
All Season 20 Firestone $68.85 $1,377.00 Import $71.40 $1,428.00 BF Goodrich $83.25 $1,665.00
LT 225/75R 16 LOAD RANGE D
Premium Steel - All Position - Long Tread 6 Bridgestone $115.00 $690.00 Import $68.25 $409.50 BF Goodrich $85.19 $511.14
LT 265/75R 16 8 Firestone $74.00 $592.00 Import $80.85 $646.80 Uniroyal $74.48 $595.84
LT 275/70 R 18 = 125/122S 8 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $169.57 $1,356.56 Continental $163.78 $1,310.24
P215/70 R 14
All Season Tread 4 Firestone $44.70 $178.80 Powerking $46.73 $186.92 BF Goodrich $46.03 $184.12
P215/75 R 15
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $51.55 $515.50 Powerking $40.43 $404.30 BF Goodrich $49.48 $494.80
P225/75 R 16 8 Firestone $70.45 $563.60 Powerking $71.93 $575.44 Uniroyal $68.90 $551.20
P235/70 R 15
All Season Tread 20 Firestone $65.00 $1,300.00 Powerking $60.38 $1,207.60 Uniroyal $54.23 $1,084.60
P235/70 R 16 - RT/S
Standard Load 40 Firestone $65.00 $2,600.00 Goodyear $99.88 $3,995.20 Goodyear $85.72 $3,428.80
P265/70 R 17 - HT 8 Firestone $81.85 $654.80 Powerking $95.55 $764.40 Cooper $100.86 $806.88
P265/70 R 17 - AT 8 Firestone $77.90 $623.20 Powerking $92.40 $739.20 Uniroyal $73.61 $588.88
P265/75 R 16 - AT 8 Firestone $80.00 $640.00 Powerking $91.35 $730.80 Cooper $88.11 $704.88
P 235/75R 15 WHITE LETTER STANDARD
All Weather On/Off Road Tread 18 Firestone $65.00 $1,170.00 Federal $58.80 $1,058.40 Uniroyal $54.17 $975.06
P 245/75R 16 WHITE LETTER STANDARD
Aggressive All Terrain Traction 29 Firestone $72.00 $2,088.00 Powerking $76.65 $2,222.85 Uniroyal $62.08 $1,800.32
P 225/75R 15 WHITE WALL STANDARD
All Weather On/Off Road Tread 35 Firestone $63.25 $2,213.75 Powerking $55.13 $1,929.55 Uniroyal $49.09 $1,718.15

180/70 R 8 X2R 10 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 Michelin $175.00 $1,750.00
P 185/70R 14 AQUA TRED II
Heavy Duty On/Off Road Highway Traction 4 Bridgestone $56.20 $224.80 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $49.23 $196.92

BID TABULATION
AUTOMOTIVE AND EQUIPMENT TIRES

Bid Opening Date: September 12. 2006

HUBER TIRE INC. RABEN TIRERIVER CITY TIRE

PAGE 1
9/14/2006



DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL USAGE BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION BRAND UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

P 225/70R 15 WHITE WALL STANDARD
Wet Traction (Goodyear Aqua Tread or equal) 16 Firestone $67.70 $1,083.20 Yoyo $53.55 $856.80 BF Goodrich $52.53 $840.48
P 205/65R 15 STANDARD
All Season Tread Design 8 Firestone $46.90 $375.20 Federal $40.43 $323.44 BF Goodrich $47.75 $382.00
P 225/70R 16 STANDARD
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 16 Bridgestone $79.00 $1,264.00 Goodyear $51.29 $820.64 BF Goodrich $79.55 $1,272.80
P 185/75R 14 STANDARD
Advanced Rib, All Season Tread Design 4 Firestone $40.85 $163.40 Powerking $33.60 $134.40 BF Goodrich $42.48 $169.92
P195/75R 14 STANDARD
Advanced Rib, All Season Tread Design 2 Firestone $38.20 $76.40 Powerking $35.18 $70.36 BF Goodrich $43.88 $87.76
Workhorse Heavy Duty Extra Grip Radial 
On/Off Highway 4 Firestone $71.80 $287.20 Federal $91.88 $367.52 Uniroyal $89.66 $358.64
P225/60 R 16
All Season Tread 10 Firestone $50.80 $508.00 Goodyear $56.78 $567.80 Uniroyal $51.36 $513.60
225/70R 19.5 LOAD RANGE F
Wrangler Radial (Goodyear or equal) 15 Bridgestone $170.00 $2,550.00 Wanli $149.63 $2,244.45 Goodyear $204.87 $3,073.05
265/70R 19.5  LOAD RANGE G
All Position - Street Tread 16 Bridgestone $205.00 $3,280.00 Toyo $267.75 $4,284.00 Goodyear $192.03 $3,072.48
315/80R 22.5 LOAD RANGE J                            
Goodyear G291 2 Firestone $315.00 $630.00 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $359.15 $718.30
355/80D 20 PILLOW DIA-1                                 
Bridgestone 2 Bridgestone $285.00 $570.00 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $409.50 $819.00
395/85R 20                                                             
All Terrain (Goodyear MV/T) 4 Goodyear $780.14 $3,120.56 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $728.56 $2,914.24

445/65R 22.5 Mich XZL 20 Ply
4 Michelin $541.33 $2,165.32 no bid $0.00 Michelin $541.33 $2,165.32

7.50R 16 LT PLY RATING D
Heavy Duty On/Off Road Highway Traction 10 Bridgestone $90.00 $900.00 Goodyear $119.68 $1,196.80 Goodyear $108.36 $1,083.60
8R 19.5 LOAD RANGE F
Unisteel G159 (Goodyear or equal) 5 Bridgestone $110.00 $550.00 Wanli $121.80 $609.00 Goodyear $179.47 $897.35
10.00-16 8-PLY R
Three Rib 4 Firestone $91.00 $364.00 East-One $96.60 $386.40 Am. Farmer $89.00 $356.00
10.00-16 8-PLY R
Four Rib 4 Firestone $91.00 $364.00 Carlisle $102.90 $411.60 Am. Farmer $85.00 $340.00
18.4-4-34
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 Firestone $335.00 $670.00 Alliance $325.50 $651.00 BF Goodrich $383.71 $767.42
20.5 X 8.010 2 no bid $0.00 Deestone $29.93 $59.86 Unknown $50.00 $100.00
12 R 24.5
All Terrain On/Off Road Highway Traction 2 Firestone $280.00 $560.00 no bid $0.00 Michelin $351.03 $702.06
10 R 22.5 STEERING, LOAD RANGE F             
Goodyear G159 1 Firestone $205.00 $205.00 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $260.94 $260.94
10 R 22.5 DRIVING, LOAD RANGE F               
Goodyear G159 1 Firestone $205.00 $205.00 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $228.62 $228.62

11 R 22.5 STEERING 25 Firestone $215.00 $5,375.00 Wanli $199.50 $4,987.50 BF Goodrich $197.13 $4,928.25
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11 R 22.5 DRIVING 25 Firestone $225.00 $5,625.00 Wanli $208.95 $5,223.75 BF Goodrich $204.65 $5,116.25
425/65 R 22.5
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 Firestone $350.00 $700.00 Wanli $409.50 $819.00 Kumho $428.06 $856.12
22.5 G 159 R 45
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 2 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00
24X2.125
All Terrain On/Off Road Design 4 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 Unknown $50.00 $200.00
5.70-8 LOAD RANGE C                                       
Carlisle 12 no bid $0.00 Carlisle $34.65 $415.80 Carlisle $35.51 $426.12
4.80-12 LIGHTED X
All Season Tread 2 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 Chen Shin $30.31 $60.62
12-16.5 NHS 10 PLY                                             
Bobcat 4 Firestone $95.00 $380.00 no bid $0.00 Constellation $121.95 $487.80
27 X 10.50 - 15 NHS Bobcat 4 Firestone $89.00 $356.00 Deestone $76.65 $306.60 Deestone $89.77 $359.08
14-17.5 NHS 10 PLY                                             
Backhoe 2 Firestone $170.00 $340.00 Deestone $183.75 $367.50 Solideal $220.00 $440.00
16.9-28 8 PLY                                                        
Backhoe 2 Firestone $281.00 $562.00 Denman $299.25 $598.50 Kelly $325.00 $650.00
24 R 21 XZL 10 Michelin $1,676.23 $16,762.30 no bid $0.00 Michelin $1,676.23 $16,762.30
18.4 - 30 Tractor 2 Firestone $359.45 $718.90 no bid $0.00 Powermark $399.00 $798.00
9.5L - 15 Tractor 4 RIB 2 Firestone $75.00 $150.00 Firestone $99.75 $199.50 Primex $38.52 $77.04
25 X 8.50 - 14 NHS                                               
Tractor                   1 Firestone $60.00 $60.00 Carlisle $63.00 $63.00 Carlisle $57.73 $57.73

25.5 X 8.0 - 14 - 4 RIB Goodyear Aircraft RIB
8 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 Goodyear $150.00 $1,200.00

25.5 X 8.0 - 14  1 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 Titan $94.00 $94.00
13-6.50-6 4P Carl Multi Rib 5 no bid $0.00 Carlisle $14.70 $73.50 Carlisle $18.95 $94.75
305 70D 16.5 2 Firestone $102.00 $204.00 Firestone $113.40 $226.80 Firestone $125.50 $251.00
265 70D 16.5 4 Firestone $71.20 $284.80 Firestone $79.80 $319.20 Firestone $95.29 $381.16

    

Number of tires bidder bid on out of 65 tires total 54  48  64  

$46,364.85 $48,649.45 $47,009.19

 

 

Total Cost to Authority if all quantities of tires were purchased for only  those 43 tires that all 
three bidders bid on.
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TYPE OF TIRE SIZE HUBER TIRE RIVER 
CITY RABEN TIRE

PASSENGER/LIGHT TRUCK TIRES 14", 15" AND 16" $4.00 $2.00 $2.50

HEAVY TRUCK/TRACTOR - ON AND OFF 
ROAD

     19.5", 20", 21",   
22.5" & 24" $6.50 $8.00 $6.00

INDUSTRIAL BACKHOE/GRADER 40 X 14 $7.50 $13.00 $15.00

ON AND OFF ROAD
     19.5", 20", 21",   
22.5", 24" & 25" $20.00 $13.00 $15.00

HUBER TIRE RIVER CITY RABEN TIRE

Usually one week 
or less

Usually 8 
days

Unclear

BID PRICE FOR DISPOSAL OF USED TIRES

LEAD TIME DELIVERY
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